

**CITY OF ELMHURST
MASONRY RESTORATION AND ROOFING REPLACEMENT Project
STR-SEG Project No. 14148
BID TABULATION SHEET**

ROOFING CONTRACTORS >>>	A-1 Roofing	Bennette & Brosseau	L Marshall Rfg	Riddiford Rfg	CSR Roofing	Kickerbocker	F and G	ATP Enterprises
SUBMITTALS								
Bid Bond	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
Enclosures	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
Acknowledge Addenda Number:	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
SUBMITTED BIDS								
Masonry Base Bid #1 ⁽¹⁾								
Roofing Base Bid #2 ⁽²⁾ :	\$356,000.00	\$326,900.00	NO BID	\$348,600.00	\$368,720.00	\$377,600.00	\$429,800.00	NO BID
ROOFING West Reservoir:	\$178,000.00	\$163,450.00		\$174,300.00	\$184,360.00	\$188,800.00	\$214,900.00	
ROOFING South Reservoir:	\$178,000.00	\$163,450.00		\$174,300.00	\$184,360.00	\$188,800.00	\$214,900.00	

⁽¹⁾Masonry Base Bid Includes a \$10,000.00 Contingency Allowance
⁽²⁾Roofing Base Bid #2 Includes a \$7,000.00 Contingency Allowance

MASONRY CONTRACTORS >>>	Action 1 Construction, Inc	ATP Enterprise	BAMR	Grove Masonry	Midwest Services	Midwest Pressure Washing & Restoration, Inc DBA/ RestoreWorks Masonry Restoration	Soumar Masonry Restoration, Inc	ECO Construction
SUBMITTALS								
Bid Bond	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>			<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
Enclosures	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>			<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
Acknowledge Addenda Number:	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>			<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	
SUBMITTED BIDS								
Masonry Base Bid #1 ⁽¹⁾	\$90,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$244,000.00	NO BID	\$193,700.00	\$246,400.00	NO BID
Roofing Base Bid #2 ⁽²⁾ :	\$200,000.00							
ROOFING West Reservoir:	\$100,000.00							
MASONRY West Reservoir:	\$40,000.00			\$119,000.00		\$87,500.00	\$113,000.00	
ROOFING South Reservoir:	\$100,000.00							
MASONRY South Reservoir:	\$34,000.00			\$109,000.00		\$87,500.00	\$113,000.00	
MASONRY North Reservoir:	\$16,000.00			\$16,000.00		\$8,781.00	\$10,400.00	

WITH DREW