
Tuesday, October 10, 2017 Bid Openings

Water Reclamation Facility Improvements

Plan Holder Bid

AMS Mechanical Systems Inc. no bid

Boller Construction 4,298,000.00

IHC Construction Companies LLC 3,910,000.00

Path Construction Company 4,120,000.00

The George Sollitt Construction Company 4,344,000.00

Williams Brothers Construction Inc. 4,950,000.00

Atrium Lift Station Improvements

Plan Holder Bid

AMS Mechanical Systems, Inc. no bid

Benchmark Construction no bid

Berger Excavating Contractors, Inc. no bid

Bolder contractors 1,630,000.00

Boller Construction Company Inc. no bid

Brieser Construction no bid

H. Linden & Sons Sewer and Water, Inc. no bid

IHC Construction Co. LLC no bid

IHC Construction Company 1,109,500.00

Joel Kennedy Constructing Corp no bid

John Neri Construction Co., Inc. no bid

Joseph J. Henderson & Son, Inc. no bid

Marc Kresmery Construction Co. 1,233,000.00

Marc Kresmery Construction LLC no bid

Martam Construction 1,221,595.00 No Bid Bond

Martam Construction, Inc. no bid

Patnick Construction no bid

Swallow Construction no bid

Water Reclamation Facility Effluent Sampling Building

Plan Holder Bid

Boller Construction Company Inc. 775,584.00

IHC Construction Companies LLC 970,247.00

Independent Mechanical no bid

Joseph J. Henderson & Son, Inc. no bid

John Burns Construction no bid

Martam Construction no bid



Water Reclamation Facility Sludge Storage Pad Modifications

Plan Holder Bid

Boller Construction Company Inc. 1,582,697.00

IHC Construction Companies LLC 1,578,170.00

John Burns Construction 1,328,661.00

Joseph J. Henderson & Son, Inc. 1,238,000.00

Manusos General Contracting no bid

Martam Construction, Inc 1,046,845.00

North Avenue (East End) Sanitary Lift Station Flood Proofing

Plan Holder Bid

Copenhaver Construction Inc. 499,103.00

Dunnet Bay Construction 511,656.92

IHC Construction Companies LLC 495,000.00

Joseph J. Henderson & Son, Inc. 662,000.00

Martam Construction 485,050.25

Rausch Infrastructure LLC 519,973.55


