
MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING OF THE 
CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ELMHURST, ILLINOIS 

HELD ON MONDAY, APRIL 4, 2011 
209 NORTH YORK STREET 

ELMHURST, ILLINOIS  
 
 
 

 

EXECUTIVE SESSION 6:45 P.M. – APPOINTMENT, EMPLOYME NT OR COMPENSATION OF 
AN OFFICER 
 

1. Executive session was called to order at 6:47 p.m. by Mayor DiCianni for the purpose of 
discussing Collective Bargaining, Land Acquisition/Disposition of Real Property, and Pending 
Litigation. 
 

Present: Diane Gutenkauf, Paula Pezza, Pat Shea, Norman Leader, Michael J. Bram, Kevin L. York, 
Scott Levin, Chris Healy, Jim Kennedy, Mark A. Mulliner,  

 

Absent: Susan J. Rose (arrived at 6:48 p.m.), Stephen Hipskind (arrived at 6:55 p.m.), Steve Morley 
(arrived at 7:29 p.m.), Patrick Wagner 

Also in attendance:  City Attorney Storino, City Attorney Peppers, City Manager Borchert, Fire 
Chief/Assistant City Manager Kopp   

Alderman Bram moved to convene into executive session for the purpose of discussing 
Collective Bargaining, Land Acquisition/Disposition of Real Property, and Pending Litigation.  
Alderman Pezza seconded.  Roll call vote: 

Ayes: Bram, Pezza, Shea, Leader, York, Levin, Healy, Kennedy, Mulliner, Gutenkauf, 
 

Nays: None      
 10 ayes, 0 nays, 4 absent 

         Motion duly carried 
 
 Alderman York moved to adjourn executive session.  Alderman Shea seconded.  Voice vote.  
Motion carried.  Executive session adjourned at 7:35 p.m. 
 

CALL TO ORDER / PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE/ROLL CALL           Attendance:  25 
 

2.  The Regular Meeting of the Elmhurst City Council was called to order by Mayor DiCianni at 7:47 

p.m.  Before the roll call, Mayor DiCianni asked for a moment of silence in respect of the two 

proclamations on tonight’s agenda for Autism and Child Abuse.   

 Present: Diane Gutenkauf, Paula Pezza, Pat Shea, Norman Leader, Susan J. Rose, Michael J. 
Bram, Stephen Hipskind, Kevin L. York, Scott Levin, Chris Healy, Steve Morley, Jim 
Kennedy, Mark A. Mulliner, Patrick Wagner  

 

 Absent:  None. 
 

Also in Attendance:  City Attorney Storino, City Manager Borchert, Fire Chief/Assistant City Manager 
Kopp, Director of Public Works Hughes, Museum Director Bergheger 

 

PROCLAMATION – AUTISM AWARENESS MONTH  

3. Mayor DiCianni was joined at the podium by Joan Olson, Dena Sidenfuss, Karen Grain, his wife 

Rose, their children and their extended family.  He then read a proclamation for Autism Awareness 

month. 

 Ms. Olson thanked the Mayor for his advocacy for Autism and thanked the first lady, Rose 

DiCianni, for her support. 

 Mayor DiCianni thanked the parents and families of autistic children for their support and devotion. 

PROCLAMATION – CHILD ABUSE PREVENTION MONTH  

4. Mayor DiCianni was joined at the podium by Jackie Haddad and Jennifer Gordon, President of the 

Elmhurst Junior Women’s Club. 

 Mrs. Haddad discussed the blue bow program which supports child abuse awareness. 

 Mayor DiCianni proclaimed April Child Abuse Awareness Month and thanked Mrs. Haddad for her 
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hard work and dedication. 

RECEIPT OF WRITTEN COMMUNICATIONS AND PETITIONS FRO M THE PUBLIC   

5. Marilyn Arado, 912 Saylor Avenue, submitted a letter to the Mayor and City Council regarding a 

power outage on Sunday, April 3, 2011 – the fourth power at her home in 2011.  She asked Council to 

use their power to hold ComEd accountable and get the problems fixed before spring rains start in 

earnest.  She also included a photo of a ComEd employee holding a small branch that was supposedly 

the cause of the April 3rd outage. 

PUBLIC FORUM   

6. Peter Salek 
 235 N. Myrtle 
 Elmhurst, IL  60126 
 

 Stated he is a scout in Troop 282 and that he is hoping to become an Eagle Scout. 
 
 Ellen Braun 
 850 S. Euclid Ave. 
 Elmhurst, IL  60126 
 

 Extended an invitation to the community to attend City Manager Thomas P. Borchert’s Retirement 
dinner.  The dinner will be held on May 13, 2011 at the Diplomat West in Elmhurst at 6:30 p.m.  
Tickets are $75/person and can be purchased by calling the Historical Museum or visiting 
www.elmhurstheritagefoundation.org . She also announced the May 5, 2011 opening of a new 
Historical Museum exhibit Toys In the Hood.  She stated the Ruth Strand Poster Contest is May 6, 
2011.  

 
 Marilyn Arado 

912 Saylor Ave. 
Elmhurst, IL  60126 
 

Spoke of the power outage on April 3, 2011 in southwest Elmhurst.  She stated this is the 4th outage 
in 2011.  She spoke of the grid problem stating that ComEd needs to address it now. 

 
 Liz Widmeier 
 908 Saylor Ave. 
 Elmhurst, IL  60126 
 

 Thanked Alderman Mulliner for searching for the reason why they lost power on April 3, 2011.  She 
stated Alderman Mulliner discovered it was a twig, not a large tree branch or limb. 

     
CONSENT AGENDA  

7. The following items on the Consent Agenda were presented:  
 

a. MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING HELD ON MONDAY, MARCH 21, 2011 (City Clerk 
Spencer): Approve as published 

 
b. MINUTES OF THE EXECUTIVE SESSION HELD ON MONDAY, MARCH 21, 2011 (City Clerk 

Spencer):  Receive and place on file 
 
c. ACCOUNTS PAYABLE – MARCH 31, 2011 TOTAL $ 892,190.92 
 
d. CANVASS – APRIL 5, 2011 CONSOLIDATED ELECTION (City Clerk Spencer):  Refer to the 

Finance, Council Affairs and Administrative Services Committee 
 

March 30, 2011 
To: City Manager Borchert 
Re: Canvass – April 5, 2011 Consolidated Election 
 
As the Local Election Authority, I request that the Finance, Council Affairs and Administrative 
Services Committee review Municipal Code section 2.12 Date of Inauguration of Newly Elected 
Officials and recommend  Council authorize the City Attorney to change said section to comply with 
Illinois State Statute 10ILCS5/1-8. 
 



Minutes of the City Council  
Monday, April 4, 2011 

Page 3 
 

I also request that the report include a motion to suspend with the rules to allow the committee report 
and relevant ordinance be approved on the same night as this issue is date sensitive. 

 
 Respectfully submitted, 

     /s/  Patty Spencer        
                   City Clerk  
 
e. BID RESULTS, CHEVY TAHOE (City Clerk Spencer):  Refer to the Public Affairs and Safety 

Committee (See item 6h.) 
March 31, 2011 

 
TO: Mayor DiCianni and Members of the City Council 
RE: Bid Results, Chevy Tahoe 
 
In response to an invitation to bid for a 4x4 Special Service Vehicle City of Elmhurst advertised in 
the Elmhurst Independent on Wednesday, March 9, 2011, bids were received from four contractors.  
All bid packages were complete. 
 

Bids were opened at 10:00 a.m. on Tuesday, March 22, 2011 by the City Clerk.  The following is a 
summary of the bids received: 

 

Dealer        Total Bid Price for PD-2 
Hoskins Chevrolet    $24,297.00 
Elk Grove Village, IL       
 
Currie Fleet     $26,050.00 
Forest Park, IL 
 
Advantage Chevrolet    $26,451.00 
Hodgkins, IL 

 
Sunrise Chevrolet    $28,655.00 
Glendale Heights, IL 

 Respectfully submitted, 
     /s/  Patty Spencer        

                   City Clerk 
 
f. REPORT – 2011 TREE PURCHASE & PLANTING PROGRAM The following report of the Public 

Works and Buildings Committee was presented for passage: 
 

March 28, 2011  
 

To: Mayor DiCianni and Members of the City Council 
Re:   2011 Tree Purchase & Planting Program 

 
The Public Works and Building Committee met on Monday, March 28, 2011, to discuss the 
purchase and installation of tree stock through the Suburban Tree Consortium for the City's 2011 
Tree Purchase & Planting Program.  This includes regular tree replacements and new tree plantings. 
    
Elmhurst joined the Suburban Tree Consortium in 1986 and is currently one of 36 participating 
members. The major purpose of the Consortium is to pool resources from several communities in an 
effort to obtain lower prices, a more dependable supply, and a higher quality of trees than would be 
available to any single municipality or agency.  The City has purchased trees through the 
Consortium previously and has been satisfied with the product and the competitiveness of the cost. 
Currently, Beaver Creek Nursery, Hinsdale Nursery, Beeson’s Nursery, Possibility Place Nursery, 
and Wilson Nursery are contracted to supply trees and Pugsley & LaHaie provide planting services.  
These contracts have fixed annual prices, which are renewed upon mutual consent of the members 
and contractors and are administered by the West Central Municipal Conference (WCMC).  
Collectively, the members purchase approximately 6,000 trees per year.   
 
A purchase summary is attached specifying tree species, numbers required, costs and the supplying 
nursery. 
 
Due to recent determinations by the Illinois Department of Labor, tree planting is now considered to 
be governed by Prevailing Wage Legislation.  While that position is being challenged by the 
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Suburban Tree Consortium, it is recommended that the City budget to pay the required prevailing 
wage rate until a final determination is made.  There are 460 trees scheduled to be purchased at a 
cost of $77,134.00.  The cost for contractor services to plant the trees is $75,900.00.  Consequently 
the final cost to the City for 2011/12 tree planting will be $153,034.00 ($77,134.00 + $75,900.00) 
less $16,000.00 or $137,034.00. 
 
Funds have been allocated in the 2011/2012 budget, General Fund for the purchase of these trees in 
account number 110-6043-434-40-61 in the amount of $85,000, and for planting in account number 
110-6043-434-30-77 in the amount of $85,000, pending Council approval of the 2011/2012 Budget.   
 
It is, therefore, the recommendation of the Public Works and Buildings Committee that the purchase 
of trees through the Suburban Tree Consortium as outlined above, be approved. 

  
  Respectfully submitted, 

Public Works and Building Committee 

         /s/  Jim Kennedy  
                     Chairman  
  /s/  Michael J. Bram 

      Vice-Chairman    
/s/   Pat Shea 

  /s/   Chris Healy 
 
g. REPORT – BIDS, 2011 CONTRACT PAVING PROGRAM The following report of the Public 

Works and Buildings Committee was presented for passage: 
 

        March 28, 2011 
 
TO: Mayor DiCianni and Members of the City Council 
RE: Bids, 2011 Contract Paving Program 

 
The Public Works and Buildings Committee met on Monday, March 14 and Monday, March 28, 
2011 to review bids for the 2011 Contract Paving Program.  The thirteen (13) bids received from 
area contractors are summarized on Attachment “A”. 
 
The bids received will provide for the grinding and bituminous overlay of approximately 4.3 miles 
of asphalt streets and removal and replacement of approximately 19,000 lineal feet of curb and 
gutter.  Other work will include utility structure adjustments, related storm sewer work, paving of 
driveway approaches, restoration of parkways, and traffic control. 
 
The contract requires that the above work at each construction location shall be completed within 45 
days from the date construction commenced at that location.  The contractor is also required to 
maintain access to residential driveways at all times, with the exception of when the curb or a 
concrete driveway is actually poured or curing. 
 
Schroeder & Schroeder, Inc. submitted the lowest responsible bid meeting all of the bidding 
requirements. Schroeder & Schroeder completed the Spring Road Business District sidewalk and 
curb and gutter replacement project in 2010 in a satisfactory manner. 
 
Schroeder & Schroeder, Inc. submitted the second lowest bid for the asphalt patching work. The 
lowest bid for this item was made by Chicagoland Paving Contractors of Lake Zurich, IL. Staff 
contacted Chicagoland Paving, who indicated they were not interested in completing the patching as 
a separate project at the bid price submitted. 
 
The bid includes $1,437,847.04 to resurface 4.3 miles of asphalt streets. The remaining 0.7 mile of 
roadway paving is St. Charles Road from York Street to the Canadian National Railroad, which will 
be funded through the Illinois Department of Transportation’s Emergency Repair Program. Monies 
for this work have been provided in the FY11/12 Budget in the following accounts as described 
below: 

 
ACCOUNT           ACCOUNT  BUDGET      BID 
DESCRIPTION     CODE   AMOUNT AMOUNT 
 

2011 Street Resurfacing  110-6041-432-80-15  $   1,500,000 $1,437,847.04 
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Asphalt Patching   110-6041-432-30-02  $        70,000 $     70,000.00 
510-6052-501-30-02  $        30,000 $     30,000.00 
510-6056-502-30-02  $        20,000 $     20,000.00 

 

Totals:  $   1,620,000 $1,557,847.04 
 

It is, therefore, the recommendation of the Public Works and Building Committee that the low bid in 
the amount of $1,557,847.04 from Schroeder & Schroeder, Inc. for the 2011 Contract Paving 
Program be accepted and the City attorney be authorized to draft a resolution approving a contract 
with Schroeder & Schroeder, Inc. 

  Respectfully submitted, 
Public Works and Building Committee 

         /s/  Jim Kennedy  
                     Chairman  
  /s/  Michael J. Bram 

      Vice-Chairman    
/s/   Pat Shea 

  /s/   Chris Healy 
 
h. REPORT – BID, ONE (1) CHEVROLET TAHOE SPECIAL SERVICE VEHICLE The following 

report of the Public Affairs and Safety Committee was presented for passage: 
          

April 4, 2011 
 

TO:  Mayor Peter P. Dicianni and Members of the City Council 
RE:  Bid, One (1) Chevrolet Tahoe Special Service Vehicle. 
 
The Public Affairs and Safety Committee met on Monday, March 28, 2011 to discuss bids received 
to replace One (1) Chevrolet Tahoe Special Service Vehicle for the Police Department. (PD-2). 
 
Invitations to Bid were sent out to (8) eight-area dealers for One (1) Chevrolet Tahoe Special Service 
Vehicle.  The results are listed below: 

 
        Total Price  

Dealer         For PD-2    
        
Hoskins Chevrolet, Elk Grove Village, IL   $24,297.00 
Currie Fleet Forest Park, IL     $26,050.00 
Advantage Chevrolet, Hodgkins, IL    $26,451.00 
Sunrise Chevrolet, Glendale Heights, IL    $28,655.00   
Castle Chevrolet, Villa Park, IL    No Bid Received  
Haggerty Chevrolet, Glen Ellyn, IL    No Bid Received  
Bill Jacobs Chevrolet, Joliet, IL    No Bid Received 
Shepard Chevrolet, Lake Bluff, IL    No Bid received   

       
The low bid from Hoskins Chevrolet, Elk Grove Village, IL meets all the specifications. The price 
reflects a trade-in allowance of $ (6,235.00) for PD-2. This unit will be used in the Police 
Department. 
 
Funds have been provided in the FY 2010/2011 Vehicle account under the following account 
number: $32,000 in 110-5030-421-80-06.   Delivery is 10 to 12 weeks after receipt of order. 
  
It is, therefore, the recommendation of the Public Affairs and Safety Committee that the City 
Council approve the purchase of one 2011 Chevrolet Tahoe from Hoskins Chevrolet, Elk Grove 
Village, IL, to replace PD-2. It is also the recommendation of the Public Affairs and Safety 
Committee that the City Council authorize the disposal of old PD-2 by trading this vehicle as part of 
the purchase. The total cost of one 2011 Chevrolet Tahoe less the trade-in is $24,297.00. 

        
       Respectfully submitted,  
       Public Affairs and Safety Committee  
       /s/  Patrick Wagner 
                 Chairman  

        /s/  Paula Pezza 
        /s/ Scott Levin 
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i. REPORT – REQUEST FOR 2011 ELMHURST JAYCEES CARNIVAL The following report of the 

Public Affairs and Safety Committee was presented for passage: 
    

March 28, 2011 
 
To: Mayor DiCianni and Members of City Council 
Re:  Request for 2011 Elmhurst Jaycees Carnival 
 
The Public Affairs and Safety Committee met on March 28, 2011 to discuss the request by the 
Elmhurst Jaycees for approval for a Temporary Use and Events Permit for a 2011 Elmhurst Jaycees 
Carnival. 
 
The 2011 Elmhurst Jaycees Carnival will take place June 10 - 13, 2011.  Carnival operators will 
arrive to set up on Sunday, June 6th, with set up starting Tuesday, June 8th.  The event schedule is as 
follows: 

 
Thursday, June 10   Carnival will be open 5 p.m. to 10 p.m. 
Friday, June 11    Carnival will be open 11 a.m. to 10 p.m.  
Saturday, June 12  Carnival will open 9 a.m. to 11 a.m. – Special Kids Day 
    Carnival will be open to public 11 a.m. to 10 p.m.  
Sunday, June 13  Carnival will open 11 a.m. to close at 5 p.m. 
 

The Carnival will take place on Park Street between Myrtle and Prospect Avenues.   
 
As a safety precaution for pedestrians walking to the Carnival, the Jaycees are responsible to provide 
crossing guards at the railroad tracks at both Myrtle and Prospect crossings, as well as street corners, 
from Prospect to York Road to assist in safe travel of pedestrians from the carnival to the location of 
the City Centre Concert Series.  The Jaycees will be working with the Police Department for 
assistance in acquiring crossing guards from Police Academy graduates and Elmhurst Police 
Explorers.   Ultimately the responsibility for crossing guards is that of the Elmhurst Jaycees. 
 
The Jaycees will provide The City of Elmhurst a written contract with Elmhurst College regarding 
the utilization of college property for carnival rides, vehicle and trailer storage and parking. 
 
All layout/staging plans and operational parameters will be finalized only after ongoing consultation 
and discussion with and written approval from the Elmhurst Police, Fire and Public Works 
Departments. 
 
Insurance will be provided by Elmhurst Jaycees and approved by the City Attorney. 
 
The Committee felt that this was a beneficial event for the City and that all details will have been 
approved by the Police, Fire and Public Works Departments prior to the issuance of the permit.   
 
If at any point prior to or during the event the Police Chief, Fire Chief, Public Works or the City 
Manager / designee feels that there is a reason to stop a ride or the shut down the carnival they have 
that right.   
  
It is, therefore, the recommendation of the Public Affairs and Safety Committee that the City 
Council authorize the City Manager to issue the Temporary Use and Events Permit as requested by 
the Elmhurst Jaycees for the proposed 2011 Elmhurst Jaycees Carnival June 10 – 13, 2011.  
   

       Respectfully submitted,  
       Public Affairs and Safety Committee  
       /s/  Patrick Wagner 
                 Chairman  

        /s/  Paula Pezza 
        /s/ Scott Levin 
 
j. REPORT – PEDICAB LICENSING AND ANNUAL FEES The following report of the Public 

Affairs and Safety Committee was presented for passage: 
 

        March 28, 2011 
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To:  Mayor DiCianni and Members of the City Council 
Re:  Pedicab Licensing and Annual Fees 
 
The Public Affairs and Safety Committee met on March 28, 2011 to discuss the request from 
Alderman Pat Wagner to review the City’s general licensing requirements and permit fees for 
pedicab operators serving the Elmhurst community. 
 
The pedicab service provides a unique service to Elmhurst’s central business district areas, adding 
quality to the ambiance of the area and is important for the vitality and charm of the area, not unlike 
horse-drawn carriage operators in the Chicago loop area.  The unique character of the pedicabs 
encourages residents and families to visit, explore and utilize Elmhurst businesses. 
 
The current annual licensing and permit fees for pedicabs serving the Elmhurst Community have a 
disproportionate impact to the pedicab operators relative to their seasonal earnings. The request is to 
revise the annual fee schedule for background checks for pedicab operators from the current $75 per 
year to $45 per year.   
 
It is therefore the recommendation of the Public Affairs and Safety Committee that the City Council 
approve a revision in the fee schedule for pedicab operators serving the Elmhurst Community by 
decreasing the annual fee for background checks for pedicab operators from the current $75 per year 
to $45 per year. 

       Respectfully submitted,  
       Public Affairs and Safety Committee  
       /s/  Patrick Wagner 
                 Chairman  

        /s/  Paula Pezza 
        /s/ Scott Levin 
 
k. REPORT – RISK MANAGEMENT INSURANCE RENEWALS – FISCAL 2012 The following 

report of the Finance, Council Affairs and Administrative Services Committee was presented for 
passage: 

         March 29, 2011 
 

To: Mayor DiCianni and Members of the City Council 
Re: Risk Management Insurance Renewals – Fiscal 2012 

 
The Finance, Council Affairs and Administrative Services Committee met March 28, 2011, to 
review the proposed risk management insurance renewals for fiscal 2012. 
 
Although basically self-insured, the City of Elmhurst maintains insurance to protect against losses in 
excess of a pre-determined self-insured loss retention (SIR).  Mr. Rich Stokluska, Area Senior Vice 
President with Arthur J. Gallagher Risk Management Services, Inc. (Gallagher), the City’s broker 
for risk management insurances, reviewed the fiscal 2012 insurance renewals with the Finance 
Committee, as presented below: 
 
General, Auto and Public Officials Liability Insurance:  The current SIR for liability coverage is 
$250,000, and the liability limit is $10,000,000.  Gallagher requested quotes from two carriers, the 
current carrier, Ironshore Specialty Insurance Co., and from Lexington Insurance Co.  Lexington 
declined to quote because they can not compete with the incumbent carrier’s current pricing and 
rates.  The fiscal 2011 premium is $135,000, and Ironshore quoted $135,000 for fiscal 2012.  The 
A.M. Best rating for Ironshore is A-XIII.  Staff recommended purchasing the policy from Ironshore 
for fiscal 2012, and the Finance Committee concurred with staff recommendation. The Finance 
Committee also reviewed the current liability limit, and concurred that it remains prudent to 
maintain the $10,000,000 liability limit.  
 
Property Insurance:  The SIR for property coverage is $100,000.  This program includes coverage 
for real and personal property, mobile equipment, data processing equipment/media and auto 
physical damage.  The property insurance also includes business interruption loss insurance, which 
is a means of protecting the City against loss of sales tax revenue if a major sales tax payer was 
impacted by a disaster such as a tornado or flood.  Chubb Group is the City’s current carrier, and the 
current premium is $49,190. The quote from Chubb for fiscal 2012 is $52,035, a $2,845 increase 
(5.8%) compared to the prior year premium.  The increase is primarily due to an adjustment in the 
value of the mobile equipment coverage.  The A.M. Best rating for Chubb is A++XV.  Staff 
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recommended that property insurance continue to be purchased from Chubb.  The Finance 
Committee concurred with staff recommendation. 
 
Excess Workers’ Compensation Insurance:  The SIR for excess workers’ compensation insurance is 
currently $500,000 for police and firefighter classifications, and $425,000 for all other 
classifications.  Gallagher requested quotes from two carriers, Safety National Casualty Corporation, 
the City’s current carrier, and Midlands/Gotham.  Midlands/Gotham declined to quote because they 
can not compete with the incumbent carrier’s current pricing and rates.  Safety National, with whom 
the City has contracted for this service since 1979, remains the most competitive excess workers’ 
compensation insurance carrier in the municipal marketplace.  The A.M. Best rating for Safety 
National is AIX.  For fiscal 2011, Safety National offered a two-year policy, with a premium of 
$69,057 for the first year with a premium rate of 4.0%.  Safety National guaranteed that the premium 
rate would remain unchanged in the second year (fiscal 2012); therefore the only change in the 
premium would be due to the change in covered payroll.  The two-year policy was selected, and the 
premium for fiscal 2012, the second year of the policy, is $70,443, a 2% increase compared to prior 
year. 
 
Broker Fees:  For three years, since fiscal 2010, all insurance premiums have excluded broker fees.  
At that time, a three-year broker fee contract was negotiated with Gallagher at the rate of $36,000 
each year. 
 
Mr. Stokluska recommended an increase in the liability limit for the City’s crime/employee 
dishonesty policy, from a limit of $100,000 to a limit of $500,000.  The deductible would also 
increase from $1,000 to $5,000.  Claims experience in this area over the last several years has 
trended to $250,000 and greater, and the $500,000 liability limit for this type of policy is now more 
standard amongst municipalities.  The annual premium would increase $516, from $1,509 to $2,025, 
for the increased coverage.  The Finance Committee concurred with the recommendation to increase 
the liability limit to $500,000 for the crime/employee dishonesty policy from Hartford Insurance 
Company. 
 
It is, therefore, the recommendation of the Finance, Council Affairs and Administrative Services 
Committee that the City Council accept the proposal from Arthur J. Gallagher Risk Management 
Services, Inc., for fiscal year 2012 for General, Auto and Public Officials Liability Insurance, 
Property Insurance and Excess Workers’ Compensation Insurance, as described above. 

       
 Respectfully submitted, 
        Finance, Council Affairs and 
        Administrative Services Committee 
        /s/ Stephen Hipskind  
             Chairman 
        /s/ Kevin York 
             Vice-Chairman 
        /s/ Mark Mulliner 
        /s/ Diane Gutenkauf 
 
l. REPORT – 538 W. ST. CHARLES ROAD VARIANCE – OVERSIGHT COMMITTEE 

FINDINGS The following report of the Stormwater Oversight Committee was presented for 
passage: 
        March 28, 2011 
 
TO: Mayor DiCianni and Members of the City Council 
RE: 538 W. St. Charles Road Variance – Oversight Committee Findings 

Request for variation from sections 15-133.5 and 15-133.15 of the DuPage County, 
Countywide Stormwater and Floodplain Ordinance for the proposed commercial development 
at 538 W. St. Charles Road.   

 
Date of Authorization: 
 Date of Legal Notice of Public Hearing  March 4, 2011 
 Date of Scheduled Hearing    March 28, 2011 

  
Petitioner’s Request: 
A variance is requested for maximum flood depth in a parking lot in accordance with section 15-
133.5 and for ten feet of fill from a floodplain in accordance with section 15-133.15 in a waiver 
community. 
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Testimony:  
Mr. Randy Bus, a professional civil engineer representing the petitioner, presented the petitioner’s 
case.  Mr. Bus explained that the petitioner is seeking to redevelopment the land where the former 
old Brady-White Furniture stood.  The existing 100-year floodplain is located within the alley to the 
south and part of Scott Street to the west.  He stated that this site is protected from Salt Creek 
flooding by the City’s levee system but that in the 100-year flood event local storm sewers can back 
up and cause flooding. 
 
Mr. Bus informed the Committee that the proposed redevelopment will include a new building that 
is located near the footprint of the former furniture building.  He stated that redeveloping the site 
while meeting the current Ordinance requirements would be very difficult and that variances would 
be needed.  Mr. Bus explained that the two variance requests were for parking lot ponding depths 
exceeding 12” in flood events and for having less than 10 feet of fill between the floodplain limits 
and the new building structure.   
 
Mr. Bus explained that the new parking stalls on the south and southwest sides of the building could 
not be raised because they had to match the existing elevation of the alley and Scott Street.  The 
petitioner would prevent cars from being flooded within these stalls by installing signage warning 
that the area is subject to flooding during extreme events.  He also stated that most of those parking 
stalls would be used by employees of the proposed businesses and their parking tendencies would 
not be for long periods of time or overnight.   
 
Mr. Bus explained that the variance requesting less than 10 feet of fill would be appropriate because 
the finished floor of the proposed building would be 3 to 4 feet higher than the 100-year floodplain.  
In addition he stated that the proposed building would not have a basement and the foundation wall 
that would be subject to contact with the flood waters would be constructed of a monolithically 
poured concrete wall which would prevent seepage. 
 
Mike Hughes, Director of Public Works, explained the requirements of the ordinance and the issues 
that lead to the variance request.  Mr. Hughes explained that the variance request was provided to all 
the Salt Creek watershed communities.  No questions or comments were received regarding this 
variance request.  He stated staff review of the variance request found no negative impacts to the 
neighborhood.  In addition staff has been in contact with DuPage County staff and they do not object 
to the variances as similar variances have been approved in the past.  DuPage County staff has 
requested that the variance only be approved by the City of Elmhurst if it is contingent upon DuPage 
County Stormwater Committee approval.  The DuPage County Stormwater Committee will hear the 
variance request on April 5th.  City of Elmhurst staff recommends approval of the variance requests 
to allow responsible development at this location.   
 
Public Comment:  
No public comments opposing this request were made. 
 
Discussion: 
Director of Public Works Mike Hughes explained the City’s responsibility to enforce and administer 
the DuPage County, Countywide Stormwater and Floodplain Ordinance.  He noted that are no 
negative impacts to the neighborhood from this proposed development. 

 
The Committee discussed the proposed development and made the following findings: 

1. Criterion:  Granting the variance shall not alter the essential character of the area involved, 
including existing stream uses; and 
Finding:   The Committee finds that the proposed building will function in the same manner 
as the former building on the property and therefore will not alter the character of the 
surrounding area.  In addition, the development will improve stormwater drainage of the 
area. 

2. Criterion:  Carrying out the strict letter of the provisions of this Ordinance or the waiver 
community ordinance would create an undue or particular hardship or difficulty on a specific 
developer or owner; and 
Finding:  The Committee finds that carrying out the strict letter of the Ordinance would 
create an undue hardship for the developer. 

3.  Criterion:  The relief requested is the minimum necessary and there are no means other than 
the requested variance by which the alleged hardship can be avoided or remedied to a degree 
sufficient to permit the reasonable continuation of the development; and 
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Finding:  The Committee finds that due to the existing grades of the alley to the south and 
Scott Street to the west that the proposed development has no means other than the requested 
variances by which the hardships can be avoided in order to meet existing grades.   

4. Criterion:  The applicant’s circumstances are unique and do not present a general condition 
or problem; and 
Finding:  The Committee finds that the proposed development is unique because it is 
protected from the floodwaters of Salt Creek by the levee system and any potential 
floodwaters impacting the site would derive from localized flooding of the storm sewer 
system.  In addition the proposed development is essentially replacing the former existing 
building while improving the site by meeting current flood proofing, compensatory 
floodplain storage, and development stormwater storage requirements. 

5. Criterion:  The subject development is exceptional as compared to other developments 
subject to the same provision; and 
Finding:  The Committee finds that the site is exceptional and without the variances this site 
may not be redeveloped. 

6. Criterion:  A development proposed for a special management area could not be constructed 
if it were limited to areas outside the special management area. 
Finding:  The Committee finds that the existing development is already partially within the 
floodplain and redevelopment of this property would not be possible without the variances. 

 
The Stormwater Oversight Committee found that the petitioner met all of the required criteria.  The 
Stormwater Oversight Committee approval is contingent on the applicant’s successful acquisition of 
DuPage County Stormwater Committee approval of this variance request. 
 
Recommendation: 
 

Based on the ability of the petitioner to satisfy the requirements for granting a variance, the 
Stormwater Oversight Committee voted unanimously to approve the petitioner’s request.  Therefore, 
it is the recommendation of the Stormwater Oversight Committee that the variance requests for 538 
W. St. Charles Road be approved as outlined above. 

 
  Respectfully submitted, 

Stormwater Oversight Committee 

         /s/  Jim Kennedy  
                     Chairman  
  /s/  Michael J. Bram 

      Vice-Chairman    
/s/   Pat Shea 

  /s/   Chris Healy 
 
m. O-12-2011 – AN ORDINANCE VACATING A PORTION OF THE SCOTT STREET RIGHT-OF-

WAY 
 

Ordinance O-12-2011 was presented for passage. 
 
n. O-13-2011 – AN ORDINANCE TO APPROVE AN EASEMENT AND OPERATION 

AGREEMENT BY AND BETWEEN THE CITY OF ELMHURST AND 538 ELMHURST, LLC 
 

Ordinance O-13-2011 was presented for passage. 
 

o. O-14-2011 – AN ORDINANCE APPROVING AND AUTHORIZING THE EXECUTION OF A 
NON-EXCLUSIVE LICENSE AGREEMENT BY AND BETWEEN THE SPRING ROAD 
BUSINESS ASSOCIATION AND THE CITY OF ELMHURST, DUPAGE AND COOK 
COUNTIES, ILLINOIS (PET/BIKE PARADE) 

 
Ordinance O-14-2011 was presented for passage. 

 
p. O-15-2011 – AN ORDINANCE APPROVING AND AUTHORIZING THE EXECUTION OF A 

NON-EXCLUSIVE LICENSE AGREEMENT BY AND BETWEEN THE YORK AND 
VALLETTE BUSINESS ASSOCIATION AND THE CITY OF ELMHURST, DUPAGE AND 
COOK COUNTIES, ILLINOIS (FARMER’S MARKET) 

 
Ordinance O-15-2011 was presented for passage. 
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q. O-16-2011 – AN ORDINANCE APPROVING AND AUTHORIZING THE EXECUTION OF A 
NON-EXCLUSIVE LICENSE AGREEMENT BY AND BETWEEN THE ELMHURST 
CHAMBER OF COMMERCE AND THE CITY OF ELMHURST, DUPAGE AND COOK 
COUNTIES, ILLINOIS (MEMORIAL DAY PARADE) 

 
Ordinance O-16-2011 was presented for passage. 

 
r. O-17-2011 – AN ORDINANCE APPROVING AND AUTHORIZING THE EXECUTION OF A 

NON-EXCLUSIVE LICENSE AGREEMENT BY AND BETWEEN MARIE RYAN AND THE 
CITY OF ELMHURST, DUPAGE AND COOK COUNTIES, ILLINOIS (ANNIE RYAN FUN 
RUN) 

 
Ordinance O-17-2011 was presented for passage. 

 
s. ZO-02-2011 – AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ORDINANCE NUMBERS ZO-01-2009, ZO-07-

2009, ZO-03-2010 AND ZO-18-2010 TO AUTHORIZE AN ADDITIONAL EXTENSION OF 
TIME FOR THE CONDITIONAL USE FOR THE PROPERTY LOCATED AT 188 WEST 
BUTTERFIELD ROAD, ELMHURST, ILLINOIS 

 
Ordinance ZO-02-2011 was presented for passage. 

 
t. ZO-03-2011 – AN ORDINANCE GRANTING A CONDITIONAL USE PERMIT FOR THE 

PURPOSE OF ERECTING A COMMUNICATIONS TOWER ON THE PROPERTY 
COMMONLY KNOWN AS ELMHURST MEMORIAL HEALTHCARE BUSINESS 
OPERATIONS CENTER, LOCATED AT 855 NORTH CHURCH COURT, ELMHURST, 
ILLINOIS (P.I.N. 03-26-301-017) 

 
Ordinance ZO-03-2011 was presented for passage. 

 
 Alderman Pezza pulled item 7t. ZO-03-2011 – An Ordinance Granting a Conditional Use Permit 

for the Purpose of Erecting a Communications Tower on the Property Commonly Known as 

Elmhurst Memorial Healthcare Business Operations Center, Located at 855 North Church Court, 

Elmhurst, Illinois (P.I.N. 03-26-301-017) from the Consent Agenda.  

 Alderman Healy moved to approve the contents of the Consent Agenda less item 7t. ZO-03-2011 – 

An Ordinance Granting a Conditional Use Permit for the Purpose of Erecting a Communications 

Tower on the Property Commonly Known as Elmhurst Memorial Healthcare Business Operations 

Center, Located at 855 North Church Court, Elmhurst, Illinois (P.I.N. 03-26-301-017).  Alderman 

Wagner seconded.  Roll call vote:   

Ayes: Healy, Wagner, Gutenkauf, Pezza, Shea, Leader, Rose, Bram, Hipskind, York, Levin, 
Morley, Kennedy, Mulliner 

   
 Nays: None 

Results:  14 ayes, 0 nays, 0 absent  
                Motion duly carried     

 Alderman Morley moved to approve item 7t. ZO-03-2011 – An Ordinance Granting a 

Conditional Use Permit for the Purpose of Erecting a Communications Tower on the Property 

Commonly Known as Elmhurst Memorial Healthcare Business Operations Center, Located at 855 

North Church Court, Elmhurst, Illinois (P.I.N. 03-26-301-017).  Alderman Rose seconded. 

 Alderman Morley stated the report was fully discussed two weeks ago, stating he has nothing more 

to add. 

 Alderman Pezza stated she pulled item 7t. ZO-03-2011 – An Ordinance Granting a Conditional 

Use Permit for the Purpose of Erecting a Communications Tower on the Property Commonly 

Known as Elmhurst Memorial Healthcare Business Operations Center, Located at 855 North 

Church Court, Elmhurst, Illinois (P.I.N. 03-26-301-017) to thank Elmhurst Memorial Healthcare’s 

Attorney Scott Day and Mr. Collander for being present and willing to answer any questions Council 
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may have had two weeks ago.  She stated unfortunately, their expertise was stifled and she was not able 

to ask any questions.  Alderman Pezza stated since her questions were not answered, she would not 

support the report. 

 Roll call vote on item 7t. ZO-03-2011 – An Ordinance Granting a Conditional Use Permit for 

the Purpose of Erecting a Communications Tower on the Property Commonly Known as 

Elmhurst Memorial Healthcare Business Operations Center, Located at 855 North Church Court, 

Elmhurst, Illinois (P.I.N. 03-26-301-017): 

Ayes: Morley, Rose, Hipskind, York, Levin, Healy, Kennedy, Mulliner, Wagner, Gutenkauf, 
Shea, Leader  

   
 Nays: Pezza, Bram 

Results:  12 ayes, 2 nays, 0 absent  
                Motion carried 

 

COMMITTEE REPORTS  
 

8. a. REPORT – ALLIED WASTE ANNUAL CONTRACT RATE ADJUSTMENT The following 
reports of the Public Works and Buildings Committee was presented for passage: 

 

 1. MAJORITY REPORT 
March 14, 2011 

 
TO: Mayor DiCianni and Members of the City Council 
RE: Allied Waste Annual Contract Rate Adjustment 
 
The Public Works and Buildings Committee met on February 28, 2011, March 14, 2011 and again 
on March 28, 2011 to discuss the Allied Waste contract and the annual rate adjustment for the 
monthly service charges.   
 
In accordance with the contract between the City and Allied Waste, the rate for services must be 
reviewed on an annual basis.  The contract contains provisions for increases to the rates charged by 
Allied Waste on an annual basis, this year the adjustment to Allied Waste’s rate is 4.5%.   
 
Internal costs for the street sweeping of leaves ($74,500) and additional salary costs ($89,587) are 
allocated to the refuse and recycling program expenses.  These costs are accounted for in the 
monthly rate adjustments. 
 
The Committee reviewed numerous options for splitting the increase.  It was determined by the 
Committee that the increase should be split 2/3 to the 33 gallon monthly fee and 1/3 to the toter 
monthly fee. 
 
The Committee felt it would be best to have the increases incorporated into the monthly rates the 
City charges residents for service.  The rate for a 33-gallon garbage receptacle will go from $14.03 
to $14.65 per month.  And the rate for the 96-gallon toter will go from $20.76 to $21.21 per month.  
The amount charged for refuse stickers and yardwaste stickers will remain at $2.25. 
 
It is, therefore, the recommendation of the Public Works and Buildings Committee that the monthly 
rates charged for solid waste removal be adjusted as outlined above effective April1, 2011. 
 

  Respectfully submitted, 
Public Works and Building Committee 

         /s/  Jim Kennedy  
                     Chairman  
  /us/  Michael J. Bram 

      Vice-Chairman    
/us/   Pat Shea 

  /s/   Chris Healy 
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 2. MINORITY REPORT 
 

March 31, 2011 
 

TO: Mayor DiCianni and Members of the City Council 
RE: Allied Waste Annual Contract Rate Adjustment 

 
The Public Works and Buildings Committee met on February 28, 2011, March 14, 2011 and again 
on March 28, 2011 to discuss the Allied Waste contract and the annual rate adjustment for the 
monthly service charges. 
 
In accordance with the contract between the City and Allied Waste, the rate for services must be 
reviewed on an annual basis.  The contract contains provisions for increases to the rates charged by 
Allied Waste on an annual basis, this year the adjustment to Allied Waste’s rate is 4.5%. 
 
Internal costs for street sweeping of leaves ($74,500) and additional salary costs ($89,587) are 
allocated to the refuse and recycling program expenses.  These costs are accounted for in the 
monthly rate adjustments. 
 
The Committee reviewed numerous options for splitting the increase.  The following points were 
some of the reasons to distribute the costs as stated below. 

 
• Moving toward a more equitable “per gallon rate” for each size receptacle 
• Promoting recycling and less waste into landfills (City of Elmhurst Sustainability Policy) 
• Minimizing refuse and recycling cost increases to the Elmhurst senior citizen population 

 
The Committee felt it would be best to have the increases incorporated into the monthly rates the 
City charges residents for service.  The rate for a 33-gallon receptacle will go from $14.03 to $14.20 
per month.  And the rate for the 96-gallon toter will go from $20.76 to $21.43 per month.  The 
amount charged for refuse stickers and yardwaste stickers will go from $2.25 to $2.40. 
 
It is, therefore, the recommendation of the Public Works and Buildings Committee that the monthly 
rates charged for solid waste removal be adjusted as outlined above effective April 1, 2011. 

 
  Respectfully submitted, 

Public Works and Building Committee 

         /us/  Jim Kennedy  
                     Chairman  
  /s/  Michael J. Bram 

      Vice-Chairman    
/s/   Pat Shea 

  /us/   Chris Healy 
 
 Alderman Kennedy moved to open discussion on item 8a1. Majority Report – Allied Waster 

Annual Contract Rate Adjustment.  Alderman Healy seconded. 

 Alderman Kennedy stated in accordance with the contract between the City and Allied Waste, ther 

ate for services must be reviewed on an annual basis.  He stated the Public Works and Buildings 

Committee (PW&B) reviewed the options for splitting the increase and it was determined by the 

committee to distribute the monthly increase 2/3 to those using 33-gallon containers and 1/3 to those 

using 96-gallon-toters. 

 Alderman Bram stated he felt the division of the adjustment increase is flawed.  Alderman Bram 

moved to substitute item 8a2. Minority Report –  Allied Waster Annual Contract Rate Adjustment 

for item 8a1. Majority Report – Allied Waster Annual Contract Rat e Adjustment.  Alderman Shea 

seconded. 

 Discussion ensued. 

 Roll call vote to substitute item 8a2. Minority Report –  Allied Waster Annual Contract Rate 

Adjustment for the Majority Report – Allied Waster Annual Contract Rat e Adjustment: 



Minutes of the City Council  
Monday, April 4, 2011 

Page 14 
 

Ayes: Bram, Shea, Gutenkauf, Pezza  
   

 Nays: Leader, Rose, Hipskind, York, Levin, Healy, Morley, Kennedy, Mulliner, Wagner 
 

Results:  4 ayes, 10 nays, 0 absent  
                Motion failed 

 
 Roll call vote on item 8a1. Majority Report – Allied Waster Annual Contract Rat e Adjustment: 

 
Ayes: Kennedy, Healy, Morley, Mulliner, Wagner, Leader, Rose, Hipskind, York, Levin  
   

 Nays: Gutenkauf, Pezza, Shea, Bram 
Results:  10 ayes, 4 nays, 0 absent  
                Motion carried 

 

REPORTS AND RECOMENDATIONS OF APPOINTED AND ELECTED  OFFICIALS  
 

9.  a. UPDATES (Mayor DiCianni) 
  

 Mayor DiCianni encouraged everyone to get out and vote tomorrow, Tuesday, April 5, 2011. 

b. STATUS OF PROGRESS ON STORMWATER COMPREHENSIVE PLAN (City Manager 
Borchert) 

 

 City Manager Borchert reported the engineering team of Burke/RJN are busy completing their data 

collection. 

 The City Manager reported ComEd will continue to provide a monthly report, and has continued to 

complete their tree trimming work. 

 City Manager Borchert stated the Stormwater Task Force has been divided into five study 

categories, they will begin their work, as stakeholders, with the Burke/RJN team and ComEd in mid-

April. 

 Alderman Healy asked if a branch can really cause a power outage.   

 City Manager Borchert stated it doesn’t take much, a squirrel, a branch or even a short circuit in a 

house.  He stated the lift station was out of power but it worked because of a generator, with the 

indicator light going on and City staff available. 

 Alderman Healy asked City Manager Borchert to speculate on causes of an outage even with a new 

power grid. 

 City Manager Borchert discussed power flow thru cross connections. 

 Alderman Bram asked did the twig in question cause a power outage on April 3, 2011. 

 City Manager Borchert replied the branch was scorched as the power went through it, between the 

two cables. 

OTHER BUSINESS 
 

10.  None. 

ANNOUNCEMENTS 

11.  City Manager Borchert announced April 13, 14 and 15, 2011 will be Spring Clean-Up Week visit 

the City website for a list of household items that are accepted for pick-up without additional stickers 

during Spring Clean Up.   

 City Clerk Spencer announced if you have any questions regarding polling place locations for 

Election Day tomorrow, please contact the DuPage Election Commission at (630)407-5600. 

 Alderman Pezza announced the next Ward 1 Coffee & Conversation will be on Wednesday, April 

27, 2011 from 8:30 a.m. – 10:00 a.m. at The Smoothie Factory, 116 S. York Street. 

 Alderman Bram announced IDOT will have a public information meeting on Western Access on 

April 5, 2011 at the Itasca Holiday Inn from 4:00-8:00 p.m. 
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 Alderman Mulliner announced Building Commissioner, Bruce Dubiel has earned the designation 

Certified Fire Marshal from the International Code Council, this is the pinnacle of professional 

certifications for fire code officials.  Mr. Dubiel is one of only 65 persons to nationwide to receive this 

designation from the Code Council.  Alderman Mulliner congratulated Mr. Dubiel on his achievement. 

ADJOURNMENT  

12. Alderman Morley moved to adjourn the meeting.  Alderman Hipskind seconded.  Voice vote.  

Motion carried.  Meeting adjourned 8: 44 p.m.      

                    
                             Peter P. DiCianni  III, Mayor  
                                                 
Patty Spencer, City Clerk 
 
 
 


