
MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING OF THE 
CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ELMHURST, ILLINOIS 

HELD ON TUESDAY, FEBRUARY 16, 2010 
209 NORTH YORK STREET 

ELMHURST, ILLINOIS  
 
 

EXECUTIVE SESSION 7:00 P.M. – PERSONNEL 
 

1. Executive session was called to order at 7:03 p.m. by Mayor DiCianni for the purpose of 
discussing Personnel. 
 

Present: Diane Gutenkauf, Paula Pezza, Pat Shea, Norman Leader, Michael J. Bram, Stephen Hipskind, 
Kevin L. York, Chris Nybo, Steve Morley, Jim Kennedy, Mark A. Mulliner, Patrick Wagner 

 

Absent:  Susan J. Rose, Chris Healy  

Also in attendance: City Attorney Storino, City Manager Borchert 

Alderman York moved to convene into executive session for the purpose of discussing 
Personnel.  Alderman Pezza seconded.  Roll call vote: 

Ayes: York, Pezza, Gutenkauf, Shea, Leader, Bram, Hipskind, Nybo, Morley, Kennedy, 
Mulliner, Wagner 

 

Nays: None      
 12 ayes, 0 nays, 2 absent 

         Motion duly carried 
 

Alderman Wagner moved to suspend executive session until after the open meeting.  Alderman Morley 
seconded.  Voice vote.  Motion carried.  Executive session adjourned at 7:38 p.m.  
 

CALL TO ORDER/ PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE/ ROLL CALL       Attendance:  18 
 

2.  The Regular Meeting of the Elmhurst City Council was called to order by Mayor DiCianni at 

7:49 p.m.   

 Present: Diane Gutenkauf, Paula Pezza, Pat Shea, Norman Leader, Stephen Hipskind, Kevin L. 
York, Chris Nybo (left at 8:25 p.m.), Chris Healy, Steve Morley, Patrick Wagner 

 

 Absent:  Susan J. Rose (arrived at 7:52 p.m.), Michael J. Bram (arrived at 7:51 p.m.), Jim 
Kennedy, Mark A. Mulliner (arrived at 7:54 p.m.) 

 

Also in Attendance:  City Treasurer Dyer, City Attorney Storino, City Manager Borchert, Fire 
Chief/Acting Assistant City Manager Kopp, Police Chief Neubauer, WWTP 
Director Streicher 

 

RECEIPT OF WRITTEN COMMUNICATIONS AND PETITIONS FRO M THE PUBLIC   
 

3.  None. 

PUBLIC FORUM   

4. Carol Vicich  
 110 Butterfield 
 Elmhurst, IL  60126 
 

 Spoke against the neighbors from unincorporated Elmhurst that are trying to delay the zoning for the 
use of Lexington and Euclid Streets by the hospital. 

 
 Tamara Brenner 
 137 Caroline Ave. 
 Elmhurst, IL  60126 
  
 Spoke against having prayers at an open City Council meeting. 
 
 Darlene Heslop 
 200 Michigan Ave. #227 
 Elmhurst, IL  60126 
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 Spoke against prayer at a open Council meeting. 
 
 Claude Pagacz 
 566 W. Gladys Ave. 
 Elmhurst, IL  60126 
 
 Spoke regarding the spending of taxpayers money by the City Council and the lack of transparency. 
 

CONSENT AGENDA  

5. The following items on the Consent Agenda were presented:  
a. MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING HELD ON MONDAY, FEBRUARY 1, 2010 (City 

Clerk Spencer): Approve as published 
 
b. MINUTES OF THE EXECUTIVE SESSION HELD ON MONDAY, FEBRUARY 1, 2010 (City 

Clerk Spencer): Receive and place on file 
 
c. ACCOUNTS PAYABLE – FEBRUARY 16, 2010 TOTAL $ 1,604,624.36  
 
d. BIDS, 2010-2012 TREE REMOVAL AND OPTIONAL DUTCH ELM DISEASE FUNGICIDE 

INJECTIONS (City Clerk Spencer):  Refer to the Public Works and Buildings Committee  
 
        February 1, 2010 
 

TO: Mayor DiCianni and Members of the City Council 
RE: 2010 – 2012 Tree Removal and Optional Dutch Elm Disease Fungicide Injections 
 
In response to an invitation to bid for the subject project advertised in the Elmhurst Press on Friday, 
January 8, 2010 , bids were received from eight area contractors. 
 
Bids were opened at 10:00 on Tuesday, January 26, 2010 and following is a summary of the bids 
received: 

 
PUBLIC AND PRIVATE REMOVAL  

 
       2010       2011       2012      Total 

Homer Tree Care $257,710.50 $262,107.50 $269,640.00 $789,458.00 
Winkler Tree $283,725.35 $289,387.70 $292,479.90 $865,592.95 
Steve Piper $310,220.50 $320,320.00 $330,500.80 $961,041.30 
Davey Tree Care $339,600.00 $339,600.00 $339,600.00 $1,018,800.00 
Landscape Concepts $394,249.40 $394,249.40 $416,407.80 $1,204,906.60 
Care of Trees $384,045.50 $403,304.50 $423,313.00 $1,210,663.00 
Clean Cut $431,300.00 $452,865.00 $475,539.75 $1,359,704.75 
Autumn Tree Care $474,665.00 $474,665.00 $474,665.00 $1,423,995.00 

 
 DUTCH ELM DISEASE INJECTIONS  
 

      2010      2011      2012      Total 
Homer Tree Care $55,770.00 $59,070.00 $62,469.00 $177,309.00 
Winkler Tree $40,854.48 $42,009.00 $42,867.00 $125,730.00 
Steve Piper No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 
Davey Tree Care $41,415.00 $41,415.00 $41,415.00 $124,245.00 
Landscape Concepts $38,775.00 $39,600.00 $39,930.00 $118,305.00 
Care of Trees $52,140.00 $54,780.00 $57,585.00 $164,505.00 
Clean Cut No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 
Autumn Tree Care $43,230.00 $43,230.00 $43,230.00 $132,660.00 

 
 

TOTAL OF BOTH  
 

       2010       2011       2012       Total 
Homer Tree Care $313,480.50 $321,177.50 $332,109.00 $966,767.00 
Winkler Tree $324,579.35 $331,396.70 $335,346.90 $991,322.95 
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Steve Piper** $310,220.50** $320,320.00** $330,500.80** $961,041.30** 
Davey Tree Care $381,015.00 $381,015.00 $381,015.00 $1,143,045.00 
Landscape Concepts $433,024.40 $433,849.40 $456,337.80 $1,323,211.60 
Care of Trees $436,185.50 $458,084.50 $480,898.00 $1,375,168.00 
Clean Cut** $431,300.00** $452,865.00** $475,539.75** $1,359,704.75** 
Autumn Tree Care $517,895.00 $517,895.00 $520,865.00 $1,556,655.00 

 
**  =  Total bid DOES NOT include Dutch Elm Disease Injection as this item was not bid by the 
Contractor. 

 Respectfully submitted, 
     /s/  Patty Spencer        

                   City Clerk  
 
e. CASE NUMBER 09 HPC-01/ANGELA L. AND CHARLES S. ANDERSON HOUSE @ 301 

ARLINGTON AVE. (City Manager Borchert):  Refer to the Development, Planning and Zoning 
Committee 

 February 8, 2010 
 

To: Mayor DiCianni and Members of the City Council 
Re: Case Number 09 HPC-01/Angela L. and Charles S. Anderson House @ 301 Arlington Ave. 

 
It is respectfully requested that the attached Historic Preservation Commission report be referred to 
the Development, Planning and Zoning Committee for their review, evaluation and subsequent 
recommendation for City Council action.   

 Respectfully submitted, 
     /s/  Thomas P. Borchert  

      City Manager 
 
f. DUPAGE MAYORS AND MANAGERS CONFERENCE 2010 LEGISLATIVE ACTION 

PROGRAM (City Manager Borchert):  Refer to the Finance, Council Affairs and Administrative 
Services Committee 

February 10, 2010 
 

To: Mayor DiCianni and Members of the City Council 
Re: DuPage Mayors and Managers Conference 2010 Legislative Action Program 
 
It is respectfully requested that the attached 2010 DuPage Mayors and Managers Conference 2010 
Legislative Action Program be referred to the Finance, Council Affairs and Administrative Services 
Committee for their review, evaluation and subsequent recommendation to City Council. 

 
 Respectfully submitted, 

     /s/  Thomas P. Borchert  
      City Manager 
 
g. I-GO CAR SHARING (City Manager Borchert): Refer to the Public Affairs and Safety Committee   
 

February 11, 2010 
 

To: Mayor DiCianni and Members of the City Council 
Re: I-GO Car Sharing 
 
It is respectfully requested that the attached letter of interest from I-GO Car Sharing be 
referred to the Public Affairs and Safety Committee for their review, evaluation and 
subsequent recommendation for City Council.   

 Respectfully submitted, 
     /s/  Thomas P. Borchert  

      City Manager 
 
h. REPORT – PEDICAB REPORT The following report of the Public Affairs and Safety Committee 

was presented for passage: 
February 08, 2010 
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TO: Mayor DiCianni and the Members of the City Council 
RE: Pedicab Report 
 
On January 11, 2010, and February 08, 2010, the Public Affairs and Safety Committee met to 
discuss a proposal for a Pedicab Service in Elmhurst.  A Pedicab is a bicycle-based rickshaw that 
carries up to 2 adults.  Mr. Bill Paschen appeared on both dates to discuss opening a pedicab 
business in Elmhurst.  Mr. Paschen advised he would like to have several pedicabs in various 
locations in Elmhurst to provide rides for citizens and tourists.  Mr. Paschen said his business would 
enhance the downtown and Spring Road areas and also be available for special events such as 
weddings and events at Wilder Mansion.  The committee asked Chief Neubauer to review pedicabs 
in similar communities and report back. 
 
Chief Neubauer reports he reviewed the pedicab service in both Chicago and Naperville.  Chief 
Neubauer is recommending following the Naperville model.  Naperville enacted an ordinance which 
allows pedicabs and requires pedicabs to be licensed.  Both pedicab companies and individual 
drivers are licensed in Naperville.  The ordinance requires: 

 
� A background check on the drivers through the clerk’s office to be paid for by the company or 

driver 
� Licensing of the vehicles 
� Driver’s license for the driver 
� Minimum of 18 years of age for the driver 
� The ability to read and speak English for the driver 
� Posting rates in the pedicab 
� Appropriate public liability and property insurance with the City named as an insured 
� Required mechanical lighting and safety equipment 
� Trip logs to be maintained by the driver 

 
Naperville limited the number of pedicabs to one company for the first year.  Chief Neubauer is 
recommending we also allow one company to be licensed for a trial period of one year.  Chief 
Neubauer is further recommending we make available 4 individual pedicab licenses to this company.  
Further, It is also recommended that Mr. Paschen provide a detailed business plan to include the 
following: 

 
� The type and manufacturer of cabs 
� Staging areas 
� Hours of operation 
� Routes of operation 
� Supervision of the pedicab drivers 
� Fees for pedicab rides 

 
It is therefore the recommendation of the Public Affairs and Safety Committee that the City Attorney 
draft an ordinance to allow for pedicabs in Elmhurst, incorporating bullet points designated by the 
Chief of Police.  It is further recommended that one company be allowed to license up to 4 pedicabs 
for the first year and that this committee will review the pedicab situation in a year from now. 

 
       Respectfully submitted,  
       Public Affairs and Safety Committee  
       /s/  Patrick Wagner 
                 Chairman  
       /s/  Chris Nybo 

                     Vice-Chairman 
 /s/  Paula Pezza 
 
i. REPORT – SQUAD CAR PURCHASE The following report of the Public Affairs and Safety 

Committee was presented for passage: 
 

February 8, 2010 
 

To: Mayor Peter P. Dicianni and the Members of City Council 
RE: Squad Car Purchase 
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The Public Affairs and Safety Committee met on Monday February 8th, 2010 to discuss the 
purchase of Four (4) squad cars for the patrol division of the Police Department.  Three vehicles 
were scheduled to be replacement under the current F/Y 2009-2010 budget. The fourth vehicle PD-
11 was totaled in a vehicle accident. The cars to be replaced are: PD7, PD10, PD11, and PD13. 
 
The vehicles will be replaced with 2010 E-85 Ford Crown Victoria with the police interceptor 
package.  Equipment manager Chanel F. Caron advises that the State of Illinois contract PSD # 
4015559 awarded to “Landmark Ford Inc” offers the base Police Interceptor package for $ 20,668.00 
per vehicle for the 2010 model year.  Adding the options required for our fleet would bring the total 
cost of $24,445.93 for one (1) marked squad and $23,464.93 for one (1) unmarked Squad (including 
delivery). Elmhurst Ford has quoted a per vehicle unit price, including required options and delivery, 
of $23,913.93 for one (1) marked squad and $23,117.93 for one (1) unmarked Squad. This is a per 
unit cost savings for one marked squad of $ 532.00 and a per unit cost saving for one unmarked 
squad of $347.00 under the state purchase bid price, with a total cost savings for four (4) vehicles 
being $ 1,943.00.   

 
Elmhurst Ford has included the following options at no charge  
 
� Key all vehicles alike to our fleet key code. 
� Provide a set of service manuals for the vehicles. 
� Provide free storage for the vehicles when they arrive. 
 
 
It is, therefore, the recommendation of the Public Affairs and Safety Committee that the cost savings 
of $1,943.00 and ensuring the police vehicles are replaced on schedule in ordering the four (4) police 
interceptor vehicles that the sale be awarded to Elmhurst Ford.  The per unit cost being $23,913.93 
for one (1) Marked Squad 2010 E-85 police interceptor and a per unit cost of $23,117.93 for one (1) 
Unmarked Squad 2010 E-85 police interceptor being replaced for a total cost of $94,859.72 be 
approved. $112,000.00 planned and budgeted for in F/Y 09/10 line # 110-5030-421-80-06 for the 
purchase of vehicles. 

       Respectfully submitted,  
       Public Affairs and Safety Committee  
       /s/  Patrick Wagner 
                 Chairman  
       /s/  Chris Nybo 

                     Vice-Chairman 
 /s/  Paula Pezza 
 
j. REPORT – DONATION OF SURPLUS BICYCLES FROM THE POLICE DEPARTMENT The 

following report of the Public Affairs and Safety Committee was presented for passage: 
 

February 08, 2010 
 

TO: Mayor DiCianni and the Members of the City Council 
RE: Donation of Surplus Bicycles from the Police Department 

 
The Public Affairs and Safety Committee met on Monday, February 08, 2010, to discuss disposal of 
surplus bicycles from the police department. 
 
Chief Neubauer reported that the police department collects between 50 and 70 bikes a year.  Most 
of these bicycles are abandoned or lost and in poor condition.  In years past, the police department 
auctioned the bikes.  This proved to be very labor intensive and costly.  The officers involved were 
paid overtime to clean and organize the bikes and put on the auction.  More recently, bikes were 
given to a company called PropertyRoom.com.  This is similar to Ebay sales.  PropertyRoom.com 
picks up the bikes and gives a portion of the proceeds to the police department.  In 2009, the police 
department portion of sales was less than $500. 
 
The Elmhurst Bike Task Force is recommending a new way to dispose of bikes.  The Task Force has 
learned of a non-profit organization called Working Bikes Cooperative that repairs bikes and sends 
them to underdeveloped nations.  Working Bikes Cooperative will pick up the bikes as they become 
available.  This organization has also been a contributor to the annual Elmhurst Green Fest in Wilder 
Park. 
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Chief Neubauer feels this is a win-win situation.  After bikes are ready for disposal, the police 
department can contact Working Bikes Cooperative to pick up the bikes in a timely manner.  This 
will help avoid clutter in the bike storage area, cut overtime costs and help a worthy cause and 
promote a “green” initiative. 
 
Therefore, it is the recommendation of the Public Affairs and Safety Committee that the City 
Attorney determine an appropriate manner for the police department to donate their surplus bicycles 
to Working Bikes Cooperative. 

       Respectfully submitted,  
       Public Affairs and Safety Committee  
       /s/  Patrick Wagner 
                 Chairman  
       /s/  Chris Nybo 

                     Vice-Chairman 
 /s/  Paula Pezza 
 
k. REPORT – YORK & VALLETTE BUSINESS ASSOCIATION’S 2010 FARMERS MARKET The 

following report of the Public Affairs and Safety Committee was presented for passage: 
 

        February 8, 2010 
 
To:  Mayor Marcucci and members of the City Council 
Re:  York & Vallette Business Association’s 2010 Farmers Market 
 
The Public Affairs and Safety Committee met on February 8, 2010 to discuss the request from the 
York & Vallette Business Association regarding the 2010 Farmers Market.  . 
 
The Elmhurst Municipal parking lot east of York on Vallette will be used as in the past.  The market 
will commence on June 2nd and run through October 27, 2010 on every Wednesday from 7:00 a.m. 
to 1:00 p.m.   
 
The Elmhurst Chamber of Commerce will provide necessary event insurance and will make the 
policy available to the City Attorney prior to the event.       
 
It is, therefore, the recommendation of the Public Affairs and Safety Committee that the City 
Council approve the York and Vallette Business Association’s 2010 Farmers Market starting June 
2nd through October 27, 2010 on every Wednesday from 7:00 a.m. to 1:00 p.m. 

 
       Respectfully submitted,  
       Public Affairs and Safety Committee  
       /s/  Patrick Wagner 
                 Chairman  
       /s/  Chris Nybo 

                     Vice-Chairman 
 /s/  Paula Pezza 
 
l. REPORT – PAWNSHOP REPORT The following report of the Public Affairs and Safety 

Committee was presented for passage: 
February 8, 2010 

 
TO: Mayor DiCianni and the Members of the City Council 
RE: Pawnshop Report 
 
On September 28, 2009, and again on February 8, 2010 the Public Affairs and Safety Committee 
met and discussed regulation of pawnshops.  Chief Neubauer explained to the committee that there 
are State laws regulating how pawnshops operate in the community.  However, Chief Neubauer felt 
a local ordinance with certain requirements would help insure public safety in future pawning 
businesses.  Chief Neubauer and the City Attorney developed a draft ordinance to regulate any 
pawnshops that move into town after the enactment of this ordinance.  Highlights of the new 
ordinance include: 
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� a $5000 licensing fee to defray costs that the police department incurs to check daily pawn 
sheets and make inspections of the business 

� a thorough background investigation of owners and workers in pawnshops 
� detailed photographs of any jewelry taken in for pawning or resale 
� video surveillance of all transactions 
� mandatory membership in “LEADS On-Line.com” – a national depository of pawned items 
� expansion of individuals who are prohibited from pawning items to include those convicted 

of theft, burglary, deceptive practice, robbery, armed robbery, intoxicated or under the 
influence of drugs 

� extended period of time the pawn owner must keep items for resale up to 30 days 
� prohibition of pawning any firearms, stun gun or taser 

 
It is therefore the recommendation of the Public Affairs and Safety Committee that the City Attorney 
prepare a final ordinance regulating pawn shops and pawnbrokers and the City Council enact that 
ordinance to regulate future pawn shops in Elmhurst. 

       Respectfully submitted,  
       Public Affairs and Safety Committee  
       /s/  Patrick Wagner 
                 Chairman  
       /s/  Chris Nybo 

                     Vice-Chairman 
 /s/  Paula Pezza 
 
m. REPORT - ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT CONSULTING CONTRACT The following report of 

the Development, Planning and Zoning Committee was presented for passage: 
 
        February 9, 2010 
 

TO: Mayor DiCianni and Members of the City Council 
RE: Economic Development Consulting Contract  
 

The Development, Planning and Zoning Committee met on February 8, 2010 to review the revised 
Strategic Plan for Economic Development for the City of Elmhurst and a Consultant Services 
Agreement from Findzall Community Marketing.  

The Acting Assistant City Manager/Fire Chief Kopp provided an overview of the revised Strategic 
Plan for Economic Development for the City of Elmhurst.  Current fiscal constraints have required 
significant redirection of revenues and a reinvention of the structure of the City of Elmhurst’s efforts 
on economic development.  

The draft document was distributed and discussed, and is summarized as follows.  The Strategic Plan 
for Economic Development will follow the recently revised and approved Comprehensive Plan and 
focus on business retention and attraction utilizing revised marketing strategies and City 
development tools as appropriate, including Special Service Areas, Tax Increment Financing and 
public/private partnerships. In the reduced budget scenario, the responsibilities for Economic 
Development activities will be the general assignment of the Assistant City Manager who will 
oversee City staff support for the program and consultant support from Mr. Charles Van Slyke, Mr. 
Ken Bartels and other parties.   

Community support for economic development will be achieved through a closer working 
collaboration and greater volunteer support from the City Elmhurst Economic Development 
Commission and the Business Alliance, which includes the Elmhurst Chamber of Commerce and 
Industry and the Elmhurst City Centre Special Service Area.  

Due to severe budget constraints, the City of Elmhurst has greatly reduced Staff, including two 
employees who were involved in economic development activities.  However, in a continued effort 
to support economic development activities in the City, the DPZ Committee reviewed a proposal for 
contractual services from Findzall Community Marketing. 

The Committee reviewed a proposal submitted by Cathy Maloney, Managing Partner from Findzall 
Community Marketing. The proposal recommends strategic focus and offers specific direction for 
tactics to support a revised and upgraded marketing and communication initiative directed at 
business retention and recruitment as well as to enhance a shop local campaign to support 
Elmhurst’s vast retail community.  
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Similar to the City’s other consulting services agreements, the contract with Findzall provides for an 
hourly rate and an average weekly delivery of time.  The Findzall contract is for $85.00 an hour, an 
average of eight hours per week, and total annual hours not to exceed 500 hours per year.  It was 
reported that City staff reviewed other opportunities for this area of consulting services and believes 
that the previous experience with the Elmhurst community as well as region-wide experience in 
economic development consulting positions Findzall as the best resource for the City of Elmhurst’s 
needs at this time.   

The Development, Planning and Zoning Committee expressed interest in further reviewing the 
details of the Strategic Plan for Economic Development prior to bringing the Plan to the full City 
Council for approval. The Committee’s consensus was to continue to study the Plan, invite feedback 
from other members of the City Council, and to engage the consultant as soon as possible. 

It was the consensus of the Committee that Cathy Maloney and Findzall Community Marketing were 
uniquely qualified to perform these marketing and communication services. 

Therefore, it is the recommendation of the Development, Planning and Zoning Committee that the 
City Council authorize the City Attorney to prepare the proper documents for the formal City 
Council approval of Cathy Maloney and the Findzall Community Marketing firm to provide 
consulting services for the City of Elmhurst per the guidelines and per the assignment described 
above. 

Respectfully submitted,  
Development, Planning and Zoning Committee  

       /s/  Steven Morley  
                 Chairman 
       /s/  Susan J. Rose 
             Vice-Chairman 

 /s/  Norman Leader 
 
n. MCO-07-2010 – AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 44 ENTITLED “MOTOR 

VEHICLES AND TRAFFIC” OF THE CITY CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF 
ELMHURST BY ADDING THERETO SECTION 44.222 ENTITLED “SEIZURE AND 
IMPOUNDMENT OF MOTOR VEHICLES USED IN THE COMMISSION OF CERTAIN 
OFFENSES” 

 
Ordinance MCO-07-2010 was presented for passage. 

 
o. R-09-2010 – A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE ISSUANCE OF A NOTICE OF AWARD 

FOR PLUMBING FOR THE FIRST STREET PARKING DECK PROJECT FOR THE CITY OF 
ELMHURST, ILLINOIS 

 

Resolution R-09-2010 was presented for passage. 
 

 Alderman Gutenkauf pulled item 5l. Report – Pawnshop Report from the Consent Agenda.  

Alderman Morley pulled item 5m. Report - Economic Development Consulting Contract. Alderman 

Pezza pulled item 5o. R-09-2010 – A Resolution Authorizing the Issuance of a Notice of Award for 

Plumbing for the First Street Parking Deck Project for the City of Elmhurst, Illinois .    

 Alderman Morley moved to approve the contents of the Consent Agenda less items 5l. Report – 

Pawnshop Report, 5m. Report - Economic Development Consulting Contract and 5o. R-09-2010 – 

A Resolution Authorizing the Issuance of a Notice of Award for Plumbing for the First Street 

Parking Deck Project for the City of Elmhurst, Illi nois.   Alderman York seconded.  Roll call vote: 

Ayes: Morley, York, Gutenkauf, Pezza, Shea, Leader, Bram, Hipskind, Nybo, Kennedy,  
Mulliner, Wagner  
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 Nays: None 
Results:  12 ayes, 0 nays, 2 absent  
               Motion duly carried   
 

  Alderman Nybo moved to approve item 5l. Report – Pawnshop Report.  Alderman Wagner 

seconded.  Alderman Nybo stated item 5l. Report – Pawnshop Report is a report to enact an ordinance 

regulating pawn shops in Elmhurst.  

 Alderman Gutenkauf stated she pulled item 5l. Report – Pawnshop Report because she had a 

question on a bullet point item, expansion of individuals who are prohibited from pawning items to 

include those convicted of theft, burglary, deceptive practice, robbery, armed robbery, intoxicated or 

under the influence of drugs.  She asked how that will work. 

 Alderman Nybo replied through background checks. 

 Alderman Gutenkauf asked for a clarification, does a person who just wants to pawn need a 

background check. 

 City Attorney Storino stated it’s the owner of the shop who receives a background check, not the 

person walking in with an item to pawn. 

 Discussion ensued on safeguarding the regulations of the shop. 

 Roll call vote on item 5l. Report – Pawnshop Report: 

Ayes: Nybo, Wagner, Gutenkauf, Pezza, Shea, Leader, Bram, Hipskind, York, Morley, 
Kennedy, Mulliner 

   
 Nays: None 

Results:  12 ayes, 0 nays, 2 absent  
               Motion duly carried   

 

 Alderman Morley stated as Chairman, he was pulling item 5m. Report - Economic 

Development Consulting Contract back to the Development, Planning and Zoning Committee for 

further review. 

 Alderman Kennedy moved to approve item 5o. R-09-2010 – A Resolution Authorizing the 

Issuance of a Notice of Award for Plumbing for the First Street Parking Deck Project for the City 

of Elmhurst, Illinois .  Alderman Bram seconded. 

 Alderman Pezza stated she pulled item 5o. R-09-2010 – A Resolution Authorizing the 

Issuance of a Notice of Award for Plumbing for the First Street Parking Deck Project for the City 

of Elmhurst, Illinois   to comment on the savings of $30,000 and asked, how did we get the bid lowered.  

She also stated she hopes the money will be put to good use. 

 Alderman Kennedy stated the savings will be put to good use.  He stated there was an error and 

the bid went out for a re-bid.  It came back $30,000 below the first bid. 

 Roll call vote on item 5o. R-09-2010 – A Resolution Authorizing the Issuance of a Notice of 

Award for Plumbing for the First Street Parking Deck Project for the City of Elmhurst, Illinois :  

Ayes: Kennedy, Bram, Gutenkauf, Pezza, Shea, Leader, Hipskind, York, Nybo, Morley, 
Mulliner, Wagner 

   
 Nays: None 

Results:  12 ayes, 0 nays, 2 absent  
               Motion duly carried   

 
COMMITTEE REPORTS  
 

6. a. REPORT – MUNICIPAL MOTOR FUEL TAX The following report of the Finance, 
Council Affairs and Administrative Services Committee was presented for passage: 
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       February 9, 2010 
 

To: Mayor DiCianni and Members of the City Council 
Re: Municipal Motor Fuel Tax 
 
The Finance, Council Affairs and Administrative Services Committee met several times, most 
recently February 8, 2010, to review a municipal Motor Fuel Tax (MFT). 
 
As the City Council is aware, the current economic environment continues to negatively impact the 
City’s General Fund revenues.  The City’s portion of the state Motor Fuel Tax has also been 
negatively impacted, declining each year since fiscal 2007, with receipts for fiscal 2010 projected to 
be approximately $142,000 below actual fiscal 2007 receipts.  Lower MFT receipts results in more 
costs being allocated to the General Fund that would otherwise be covered by MFT funds.  To help 
bridge the gap, staff proposed implementing a municipal MFT, which is allowed for home rule 
communities.     
 
There are currently fourteen gas stations operating in Elmhurst (see attached map).  Staff conducted 
a price survey on January 6, 2010, of seventy-one gas stations including the fourteen Elmhurst 
stations and stations in Addison, Bellwood, Bensenville, Berkeley, Franklin Park, Hillside, Lombard, 
Melrose Park, Northlake, Oak Brook, Oakbrook Terrace and Villa Park (see attached).  The per 
gallon price ranged from $2.73 at Delta Sonic in Elmhurst to $2.99 at Mobil in Bellwood.  Based on 
information received from Texor, operator of the Citgo station on Butterfield Road in Elmhurst, an 
estimate of average monthly fuel sales for the stations in Elmhurst is 100,000 gallons, which equates 
to 16,800,000 gallons annually.  A motor fuel tax of one and one-half cents ($.015) per gallon would 
provide annual revenue of approximately $250,000.   
 
The Finance Committee reviewed the above information along with receiving input from several gas 
station operators.  Concerns were discussed regarding competitiveness with neighboring 
communities, impact on gas station profitability and ongoing operations, and impact on in-store 
merchandise sales.  Staff believes that a municipal MFT of $.015 per gallon, which is below the 
Cook County MFT of $.02 per gallon, would allow Elmhurst stations to remain competitive with 
neighboring communities, whether by passing along the tax or by absorbing some of the tax, and 
would have minimal impact on in-store merchandise sales. 
 
After further discussion, the Finance Committee concurred with staff recommendation to implement 
a $.015 municipal Motor Fuel Tax, effective May 1, 2010, with a staff review after six months, and a 
formal Finance Committee review after twelve months. 
 
It is, therefore, the recommendation of the Finance, Council Affairs and Administrative Services 
Committee that the City Council approve a municipal Motor Fuel Tax of one and one-half cents 
($.015) per gallon on all grades and types of petroleum, and direct the City Attorney to prepare the 
ordinance for implementation May 1, 2010. 

 Respectfully submitted, 
        Finance, Council Affairs and 
        Administrative Services Committee 
      
        /s/ Stephen Hipskind  
             Chairman 
        /s/ Kevin York 
             Vice-Chairman 
        /s/ Mark Mulliner 
        /us/ Diane Gutenkauf 
        

 Mayor DiCianni pulled item 6a. Report – Municipal Motor Fuel Tax from the agenda and sent 

it back to the Finance, Council Affairs and Administrative Services Committee. 

 Alderman Bram, point of order, is it sufficient for the Chair to pull back an item to committee or 

does a member of said committee need to do it. 

 City Attorney Storino stated it is appropriate for the Chair to remove an item from the agenda. 
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REPORTS AND RECOMENDATIONS OF APPOINTED AND ELECTED  OFFICIALS  
 

7.  a. UPDATES (Mayor DiCianni) 
  
 Mayor DiCianni announced at the 7:00p.m. on Monday, February 22, 2010 prior to the 

committee meetings the Development, Planning & Zoning Committee will have an update on Hahn 

Street.  The meeting will be in the Council Chambers.   

 Mayor DiCianni stated it is his intention for the prayer issue to be fully vetted by the Finance, 

Council Affairs and Administrative Services Committee.  

OTHER BUSINESS 
 

8.  Alderman Pezza asked for an update on the parking garage.  She asked City Manager Borchert if 

Council had received the final drawings. 

 City Manager Borchert replied yes. 

 Mayor DiCianni stated the project is on schedule and should be completed in August 2010. 

 Alderman York updated Council on the installation of a parking “pay station” machine along the 

rail line.  He stated that should be completed in Spring 2010. 

ANNOUNCEMENTS 

9. City Manager Borchert announced the presentation of the Character Counts awards will be held 

on Thursday, May 20, 2010 at Elmhurst College.  Nominations for awards are being accepted.  Forms 

can be obtained in the Administration Office of City Hall. 

 Alderman Gutenkauf announced the next Coffee & Conversation for First Ward residents will be 

held on Thursday, February 25, 2010 from 6:30 p.m. – 8:00 p.m. at Serene Teaz on 108 W. Park 

Avenue. 

 Mayor DiCianni announced ECAF will host a Casino night on Saturday, February 20, 2010 at 

the Diplomat West banquet hall. 

EXECUTIVE SESSION 8:27 P.M. – PERSONNEL 
 

1. Executive session was called to order at 8:27 p.m. by Mayor DiCianni for the purpose of 
discussing Personnel. 
 

Present: Diane Gutenkauf, Paula Pezza, Pat Shea, Norman Leader, Michael J. Bram, Stephen Hipskind, 
Kevin L. York, Chris Nybo, Steve Morley, Jim Kennedy, Mark A. Mulliner, Patrick Wagner 

 

Absent:  Susan J. Rose, Chris Healy  

Also in attendance:   City Attorney Storino, City Manager Borchert, Fire Chief/Acting Assistant City   
Manager Kopp 

Alderman York moved to reconvene into executive session for the purpose of discussing 
Personnel.  Alderman Pezza seconded.  Roll call vote: 

Ayes: York, Pezza, Gutenkauf, Shea, Leader, Bram, Hipskind, Nybo, Morley, Kennedy, 
Mulliner, Wagner 

 

Nays: None      
 12 ayes, 0 nays, 2 absent 

         Motion duly carried 
 

Alderman Wagner moved to adjourn executive session.  Alderman Morley seconded.  Voice vote.  
Motion carried.  Executive session adjourned at 9:09 p.m. 
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ADJOURNMENT  
 

10.  Alderman Wagner moved to adjourn the meeting. Aldermen Morley seconded.  Voice Vote.  

Motion carried. Meeting adjourned 9:09 p.m.      

 
                    
                            Peter P. DiCianni  III, Mayor  
 
                                                 
Patty Spencer, City Clerk 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 


